
We are long-term, patient, and active value
investors. Value investing is the discipline of
buying securities at significant discounts
from their current underlying values and
holding them until more of their value is
realized. This usually means owning
investments that are out of favor, such as
companies with disappointing short-term
earnings or weak economic conditions within
their industry or region. As value investors,
we are primarily attracted to asset oriented
securities trading at low prices compared to
their underlying book value, replacement
costs, or liquidating values; especially those
that generate significant free cash flows.
We believe by following this strategy we are
buying assets at significant discounts. Our
goal is to earn satisfactory real returns on
investment, and we are not concerned with
the relative performance of our investments
in the short term. We primarily focus on a
company’s equity securities due to their
liquidity and growth characteristics;
however, we will invest in other publicly
traded securities such as debt and preferred
stock if the opportunity arises.
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